
 

Page 1 

ORDINANCE 24-744 

 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF TAYLOR 

LAKE VILLAGE, TEXAS, UPDATING THE EXHIBIT OF 

AMENDMENTS TO THE ADOPTED INTERNATIONAL BUILDING 

CODES ADDING SECTION 3114 WATERFRONT STRUCTURES. 

 

*  *  *  *  * 

WHEREAS, the City of Taylor Lake Village (“City”) is required to comply with FEMA 

regulations; and  

 

WHEREAS, the City needs to review plans for waterfront structures to insure that they comply 

with FEMA; and 

 

WHEREAS, the City’s code of ordinances currently allows a permitting by the General Land 

Office or the City;  

 

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 

OF TAYLOR LAKE VILLAGE, TEXAS: 

 

 Adopt the addition of Section 3114 Waterfront Structures to “EXHIBIT A:  TAYLOR 

LAKE VILLAGE LOCAL AMENDMENTS TO MUNICIPAL BUILDING CODES” 

 

 PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED this the 6th day of March 2024.   

    

 

       APPROVED: 

 

 

       __________________________ 

       Jon Keeney 

       Mayor 

ATTEST: 

 

 

_________________________ 

Stacey Fields 

City Secretary 

 

 



 

Exhibit A 

Page 1 

EXHIBIT A  

TAYLOR LAKE VILLAGE  

LOCAL AMENDMENTS TO MUNICIPAL BUILDLING CODES 

 

(a) Building Code Amendments 

The following revisions are made to the building code adopted in Chapter 10 of the City Code.  

 

Section 103. Department of Building Safety, is deleted in its entirety.  

 

Section 104.8. Liability is deleted in its entirety. 

 

Section 105.2. Work Exempt From Permit, Is amended to delete the following subsections 

from the “Building” category so that a building permit is required for all fences, retaining 

walls, accessory structures, sidewalks, and driveways:  

 

1. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, 

playhouses and similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 120 square 

feet (11 m2). 

2. Fences not over 7 feet (2134 mm) high. 

4. Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet (1219 mm) in height measured from the 

bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge. 

6. Sidewalks and driveways not more than 30 inches (762 mm) above adjacent 

grade, and not over any basement or story below and are not part of an accessible 

route. 

 

Section 113. Board of Appeals, is deleted in its entirety. 

 

Section 1612.3. Establishment of Flood Hazard Areas, is amended to read as follows: Flood 

Hazard Areas shall be those established by City Code Section 34-37.  

 

 

SECTION 3114 – WATERFRONT STRUCTURES 

 

Section 3114.1 General. In addition to other requirements of this code, all waterfront structures 

including but not limited to docks, piers, wharves, floats, mooring piles, anchor buoys, bulkheads, 

submerged or overhead wires, pipes, and cables, and any object passing beneath, through or over 

the water beyond the line of ordinary high water or on Taylor Lake within the corporate limits of 

Taylor Lake Village shall comply with the regulations of this section. 

 

Section 3114.2.1 Approvals required. Before any permit for a new waterfront structure or revisions 

to an existing waterfront structure is issued by the building official, the applicant shall obtain prior 

approval from all applicable state and federal agencies. 

 



 

Exhibit A 

Page 2 

Section 3114.2.2 A person may not modify a shoreline or construct a dock, bulkhead, or shoreline 

access unless the person first obtains a site plan and building permit, as applicable, and pays the 

applicable permit fee set by ordinance. 

 

Section 3114.2.3 The building official shall require the applicant to place an identification or 

registration tag on a dock. A person may not remove a tag placed under this subsection. 

 

Section 3114.2.4 A permit obtained under this section shall be prominently displayed at the 

construction site until the final inspection and approval by the building official. 

 

Section 3114.2.5 The building official may not approve an application for a permit for the 

construction of more than one residential dock or other similar structures on a single lot zoned 

residential. 

 

Section 3114.3 Definitions. For the purposes of this section, certain terms are defined as follows: 

 

BULKHEAD. A retaining wall or erosion-control structure along a waterfront. 

 

COVERED WATERFRONT STRUCTURE. Any waterfront structure covered in whole or in part 

by a roof. 

 

COVERED WATERFRONT STRUCTURE BUILDING AREA. The area lying directly beneath 

the portion of a structure covered by a roof. 

 

SUBSTRUCTURE. That portion of the construction of a dock, pier, wharf or other similar 

waterfront structure below and including the deck. 

 

SUPERSTRUCTURE. That portion of the construction of a dock, pier, wharf or other similar 

waterfront structure above the deck. 

 

Section 3114.4 Construction Requirements. Waterfront structures shall comply with Sections 

3112.4.1 through 3112.4.12. 

 

Section 3114.4.1 Substructure. The substructure may be constructed of any materials allowed by 

this code. All decks shall sustain, within the limitations of this code, all dead loads plus a live load 

of not less than 100 pounds per square foot, assumed to act vertically. In addition to the live load 

requirement, all structures and every portion thereof shall be designed and constructed to resist a 

horizontal force of not less than 100 pounds per lineal foot acting at the deck line, in any direction. 

 

Exception: For waterfront structures serving only a single dwelling, a live load of 40 psf may be 

used and a horizontal force need only be considered where applicable. 

 

Section 3114.4.2 Superstructure. The superstructure shall be designed and constructed to sustain 

all dead loads, live loads, and wind loads required by this code, and shall be constructed of any 

materials allowed by this code, except when the building area of a covered waterfront structure 

exceeds 1,000 square feet the entire superstructure and deck shall be constructed of 

noncombustible materials or as required for Type IV-HT Construction per IBC Section 602.4. 



 

Exhibit A 

Page 3 

 

Section 3114.4.3 Hardware. All hardware used structurally shall be of a corrosive-resistant metal 

such as aluminum, brass, copper, and stainless steel, or be completely protected by an approved 

corrosion-resistant metal, such as zinc. 

 

Section 3114.4.4. Docks.  A dock must comply with the requirements of this Code; and be braced 

to withstand pressure of wind and water when boats are tied to the dock.  A floating dock must be 

supported by solid displacement flotation devices with durable nonferrous protective coverings. 

The flotation material must be securely attached to the dock and must be capable of withstanding 

prolonged exposure to wave action and weather.  A retaining wall, bulkhead, or other erosion 

protection device must be constructed to minimize wave return and wave action by using design 

and materials prescribed by rule.  

 

Section 3114.4.5.  Bulkheads.  A retaining wall, bulkhead, or other erosion protection device may 

not capture or recapture land on a lake, including Taylor Lake, unless capturing or recapturing the 

land is required to restore the land to the lesser of: 

(1) the shoreline as it existed 10 years before the date of application, or 

(2) the lakeside boundary of the subdivided lot line. 

 

Section 3114.4.6.  Electrical requirements. Wiring on a dock must be enclosed in rigid conduit or 

weatherproof flexible conduit with appropriate fittings. 

 

Section 3114.4.7.  Navigation hazards prohibited.  A dock or other structure must be constructed 

so that it is not a hazard to navigation or safety. 

 

Section 3114.4.8.  Septic tanks prohibited.  Septic tanks and sewage holding tanks are prohibited. 

 

Section 3114.4.9.  Living quarters prohibited.  A business or a living quarter may not be 

constructed on a pier or similar structure extending into Taylor Lake Village. 

 

Section 3114.4.10.  Boat ramps prohibited.  Construction of a boat ramp is prohibited. 

 

Section 3114.4.11.  Environmental protection.  The maintenance and repair of watercraft shall be 

performed in a manner that prevents discharge of fuel, oil, or other pollutants into the water.  

Containers of hazardous materials, fuel, oil, herbicides, insecticides, fertilizers, or other pollutants 

may not be stored on docks extending into Taylor Lake. 

 

Section 3114.4.12.  Nuisance abatement.  On a determination by a city official or employee that a 

dock has become, or is in imminent danger of becoming, structurally unsound, the building 

official: (1) shall take action to declare the dock a hazard; (2) shall abate the hazard under this 

Code (Dangerous Buildings Code), at the owner’s expense; and (3) may impose a lien on the 

affected property for the collection of the expense. 

 

 

(b) Residential Code Amendments 

The following revisions are made to the residential code adopted in Chapter 10 of the City 

Code. 



 

Exhibit A 

Page 4 

 

Section R103. Department of Building Safety, is deleted in its entirety. 

 

Section R104.8. Liability, is deleted in its entirety 

. 

Section R105.2. Work Exempt From Permit, is amended to delete the following 

subsections from the “Building” category so that a building permit is required for all fences, 

retaining walls, accessory structures, and driveways:  

 

1. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, 

playhouses and similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 200 square 

feet (18.58 m2). 

2. Fences not over 7 feet (2134 mm) high. 

3. Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet (1219 mm) in height measured from the 

bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge. 

5. Sidewalks and driveways. 

 

Section R112. Board of Appeals, is deleted in its entirety.  

 

Table R301.2(1). Insert the following:  

Speed 

(mph)

Topographic 

effects

Special 

wind 

region

Wind-

borne 

debris 

zone

Weathering

Frost 

line 

depth

Termite

5
120 b 

or c
small hills NA NA A Negligible 0"

Very 

heavy
32 No

City Code 

Sec. 34-

37

9 69.9

Lattitude
Winter 

heating

Summer 

cooling

Indoor design 

temperature

Wind 

velocity 

heating

Wind 

velocity 

cooling

Coincident 

wet bulb

Winter 

humidity

AIR 

FREEZING 

INDEX

MEAN 

ANNUAL 

TEMP

SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM

MANUAL J DESIGN CRITERIA

Cooling temperature difference

Elevation

Daily range

Altitude correction factor

Heating 

temperature 

difference

GROUND 

SNOW 

LOAD

WIND DESIGN

SEISMIC 

DESIGN 

CATEGORY

WINTER 

DESIGN TEMP

ICE BARRIER 

UNDERLAYMENT 

REQUIRED

FLOOD 

HAZARDS

Design temperature cooling

Summer humidity

156

-

*Manual J Design Criteria: Refer to Section M1401.3 and N1103.7 of the 2018 IRC. 

 

Sections R905.7 and R905.8 of the residential code are deleted in their entirety, including 

all subsections, and a new section R905.7 is substituted as follows:  

R905.7. Wood shingles and shakes.  

(1) Wood shingles and shakes are not allowed, shall not be allowed as an alternative 

material and shall not be installed or used on any new construction or re-roofing 

of any structure.  

(2) Existing structures which have wood shingles or shakes may be repaired with 

fire-retardant shingles or shakes of a comparable grade; however, owners shall 

have the option of installing any allowed class A, class B or class C roofing 

material over the existing wood shingles and shakes providing the existing roof 

structural system is adequate for modification. "Repair" as used in this section 

means the replacement of damaged or destroyed shingles or shakes, provided 

the area repaired does not exceed 25 percent of the surface area of the roof. A 

wood shingle or shake roof may not be replaced with wood shingles or shakes 

in increments which are undertaken as repairs.  

Section P2603.5.1. Sewer Depth, insert: twelve inches (12”) and twelve inches (12”), 

respectively. 



 

Exhibit A 

Page 5 

 

(c) Fire Code Amendments 

The following revisions are made to the fire code adopted in Chapter 10 of the City Code. 

 

Section 103. Department of Fire Prevention, is deleted in its entirety. 

 

Section 109. Board of Appeals, is deleted in its entirety. 

 

Section 307. Is amended by adding the following subsection:  

307.1.2 Outdoor or Open Fires Prohibited. No person shall burn or authorize the 

burning of any rubbish, trash, waste, leaves, weeds, grass, lumber, or any other 

combustible materials within the City.  

Section 903.2.8. Is amended to read as follows: An automatic sprinkler system installed in 

accordance with Section 903.3 shall be provided throughout all buildings with a Group R 

fire area, including multi-family structures, townhouses, tri-plex and quadplex (fourplex) 

apartments, when they contain three or more dwelling units. This section shall not apply to 

detached one- and two-family dwelling units or units separated by a fire wall when the 

design of the units and fire wall is approved by the building official in writing in response 

to submittal of complete construction plans. 

 

Section 5704.2.9.6.1. Insert: in accordance with City Code, Texas Railroad Commission, 

or Texas Commission on Environmental Quality Rules where applicable. 

 

Section 5706.2.4.4. Insert: in accordance with City Code, Texas Railroad Commission, or 

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality Rules where applicable. 

 

Section 5806.2. Insert: in accordance with City Code, Texas Railroad Commission, or 

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality Rules where applicable. 

 

Section 6104.2. Insert: in accordance with City Code, Texas Railroad Commission, or 

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality Rules where applicable. 

 

(d) Energy Conservation Code Amendments 

The following revisions are made to the energy conservation code adopted in Chapter 10 of 

the City Code. 

 

Section C102.1.2 and R102.1.2 are added and shall read as follows: 

 

C102.1.2 Alternative compliance. A building certified by a national, state, or local 

accredited energy efficiency program and determined by the Energy Systems 

Laboratory to be in compliance with the energy efficiency requirements of this 

section may, at the option of the Building official, be considered in compliance. 

The United States Environmental Protection Agency's Energy Star Program 

certification of energy code equivalency shall be considered in compliance. 

 



 

Exhibit A 

Page 6 

R102.1.2 Alternative compliance. A building certified by a national, state, or local 

accredited energy efficiency program and determined by the Energy Systems 

Laboratory to be in compliance with the energy efficiency requirements of this 

section may, at the option of the Building official, be considered in compliance. 

The United States Environmental Protection Agency's Energy Star Program 

certification of energy code equivalency shall be considered in compliance. 

Regardless of the program or the path to compliance, each 1- and 2-family dwelling 

shall be tested for air and duct leakage as prescribed in Section R402.4 and 

R403.3.3 respectively. 

 

TABLE R406.4, is amended to read as follows in accordance with the International Energy 

Conservation Code as amended and adopted by the Texas Legislature: 

 

TABLE R406.4 MAXIMUM ENERGY RATING INDEX 

(This table is effective until August 31, 2019) 

TABLE R406.4 MAXIMUM ENERGY RATING INDEX 

(This table is effective from September 1, 2019 to August 31, 2022)  

 

 

 

TABLE R406.4 MAXIMUM ENERGY RATING INDEX 

(This table is effective on or after September 1, 2022) 

 

 

 
 

(e) Fuel Gas Code Amendments  

The following revisions are made to the fuel gas code adopted in Chapter 10 of the City 

Code. 

 

Section 103. (FGC) Department of Inspection, is deleted in its entirety. 

 

Section 106.6.2 and 106.6.3. Fee Schedule and Fee Refunds, are amended to read as 

follows: The fee for work schedule shall be as adopted by City Council.  

 

Section 109. Means of Appeal, is deleted in its entirety.  

 

(f) National Electrical Code Amendments  

Reserved. 

 

(g) Mechanical Code Amendments  

The following revisions are made to the mechanical code adopted in Chapter 10 of the City 

Code. 

 

CLIMATE ZONE ENERGY RATING INDEX 

2 65 

CLIMATE ZONE ENERGY RATING INDEX 

2 63 

CLIMATE ZONE ENERGY RATING INDEX 

2 59 



 

Exhibit A 

Page 7 

Section 103.4. Liability, is deleted in its entirety.  

 

Section 106.5.2. Fee Schedule, is amended to read as follows: The fees for mechanical 

work shall be in accordance with the fee schedule adopted by the City of Taylor Lake 

Village. 

 

Section 109. Means of Appeal, is deleted in its entirety. 

 

(h) Plumbing Code Amendments  

The following revisions are made to the plumbing code adopted in Chapter 10 of the City 

Code. 

 

Section 103. Department of Plumbing Inspection, is deleted in its entirety.  

 

Section 106.6.2 and 106.6.3. Fee Schedule and Fee Refunds, are amended to read as 

follows: The fee for work schedule shall be as adopted by City Council.  

 

Section 109. Means of Appeal, is deleted in its entirety. 

Section P305.6.1. Sewer Depth, insert: twelve inches (12”) and twelve inches (12”), 

respectively. 

 

Section P903.1. Roof Extensions, insert: twelve inches (12"). 

 

(i) Property Maintenance Code Amendments 

The following revisions are made to the property maintenance code adopted in Chapter 10 of 

the City Code.  

 

Chapter 1 is replaced with Exhibit B attached to this ordinance and incorporated herein by 

reference showing amendments and deletions to that chapter in accordance with Chapters 

214 and 54 of the Texas Local Government Code. 

 

Section 302.4. Insert: six inches (6”). 

 

Section 303.1. Is amended to read as follows: Swimming pools shall be maintained in a 

clean and sanitary condition, and in good repair. Swimming pools containing water that is 

black or green in color, or that contain algae or other plants shall be deemed unsanitary. 

 

Section 304.14. Is amended to require ventilation screens year round. 

 

Section 602.3. Insert: November 1, February 28. 

 

Section 602.4. Insert: November 1, February 28. 

 

(j) Existing Building Code 

The following revisions are made to the existing building code adopted in Chapter 10 of the 

City Code. 

 



 

Exhibit A 

Page 8 

 

Section 103. Department of Building Safety, is deleted in its entirety. 

 

Section 104.8. Liability, is deleted in its entirety. 

 

Section 112. Board of Appeals, is deleted in its entirety. 

 

Section 1401.2. Effective Date, insert: June 1, 2017. 

 

(k) Private Sewage Disposal Code 

The following revisions are made to the private sewage disposal code adopted in Chapter 10 

of the City Code. 

 

Section 103. Department of Private Sewage Disposal Inspection, is deleted in its entirety. 

 

Section 106.4.2 and 106.4.3. Fee Schedule and Fee Refunds, are amended to read as 

follows: The fee for work schedule shall be as adopted by City Council.  

 

Section 109. Means of Appeal, is deleted in its entirety. 

 

Section 405.2.5. Insert: such date as prescribed by TCEQ regulations or the building 

official. 

 

Section 405.2.6. Insert: such date as prescribed by TCEQ regulations or the building 

official. 

 

(l) Swimming Pool and Spa Code 

The following revisions are made to the swimming pool and spa code adopted in Chapter 10 

of the City Code. 

 

Section 103. Department of Building Safety, is deleted in its entirety.  

 

Section 105.6.2 and 105.6.3. Fee Schedule and Fee Refunds, are amended to read as 

follows: The fee for work schedule shall be as adopted by City Council.  

 

Section 108. Means of Appeal, is deleted in its entirety. 

 

 



 

 

EXHIBIT B  

TAYLOR LAKE VILLAGE 

LOCAL AMENDMENTS TO CHAPTER 1 OF THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY 

MAINTENANCE CODE 

 

(This chapter to replace chapter 1 of the IPMC in all field manuals and official City copies) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



CHAPTER 1 
SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION 

 

Page 1 

PART 1 — SCOPE AND APPLICATION 

SECTION 101 
GENERAL 

[A] 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the 
International Property Maintenance Code of the City of Taylor 
Lake Village (the “City”), including any additions, deletions, or 
changes, hereinafter referred to as “this code.” 

[A] 101.2 Scope. The provisions of this code shall apply to all 
existing residential and nonresidential structures and all 
existing premises and constitute minimum requirements and 
standards for premises, structures, equipment and facilities 
for light, ventilation, space, heating, sanitation, protection from 
the elements, a reasonable level of safety from fire and other 
hazards, and for a reasonable level of sanitary maintenance; 
the responsibility of owners, owner’s authorized agent, 
operators and occupants; the occupancy of existing structures 
and premises, and for administration, enforcement and 
penalties. 

[A] 101.3 Intent. This code shall be construed to secure its 
expressed intent, which is to ensure public health, safety and 
welfare insofar as they are affected by the continued 
occupancy and maintenance of structures and premises. 
Existing structures and premises that do not comply with 
these provisions shall be altered or repaired to provide a 
minimum level of health and safety as required herein. 

[A] 101.4 Severability. If a section, subsection, sentence, 
clause or phrase of this code is, for any reason, held to be 
unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of 
the remaining portions of this code. 

SECTION 102 
APPLICABILITY 

[A] 102.1 General. Where there is a conflict between a 
general requirement and a specific requirement, the specific 
requirement shall govern. Where differences occur between 
provisions of this code and the referenced standards, the 
provisions of this code shall apply. Where, in a specific case, 
different sections of this code or a section of this code and 
another requirement of the City specify different requirements, 
the most restrictive shall govern. 

[A] 102.1.1 Treatment of Apartment Complexes For the 
purposes of this code, an apartment complex shall be 
treated as a single structure if common areas fail to be 
maintained in violation of the International Property 
Maintenance Code, as adopted and amended by the city. 
All other buildings on the same premises of an apartment 
complex shall be treated as a single structure. Common 
stairwells and walkways of each building shall be common 
areas for purposes of this code. 

[A] 102.2 Maintenance. Equipment, systems, devices and 
safeguards required by this code or a previous regulation or 
code under which the structure or premises was constructed, 

altered or repaired shall be maintained in good working 
order. No owner, owner’s authorized agent,  operator or 
occupant shall cause any service, facility, equipment or 
utility that is required under this section to be removed 
from, shut off from or discontinued for any occupied 
dwelling, except for such temporary interruption as 
necessary while repairs or alterations are in progress. The 
requirements of this code are not intended to provide the 
basis for removal or abrogation of fire protection and 
safety systems and devices in existing structures. Except 
as otherwise specified herein, the owner or the owner’s 
authorized agent shall be responsible for the maintenance 
of buildings, structures and premises. 

[A] 102.3 Application of other codes. Repairs, additions 
or alterations to a structure, or changes of occupancy, 
shall be done in accordance with the procedures and 
provisions of the International Building Code, 
International Existing Building Code, International Energy 
Conservation Code, International Fire Code, International 
Fuel Gas Code, International Mechanical Code, 
International Residential Code, International Plumbing 
Code and NFPA 70. Nothing in this code shall be 
construed to cancel, modify or set aside any provision of 
the International Zoning Code or any other requirement of 
the City. 

[A] 102.4 Existing remedies. The provisions in this code 
shall not be construed to abolish or impair existing 
remedies of the jurisdiction or its officers or agencies 
relating to the removal or demolition of any structure that 
is dangerous, unsafe and insanitary. 

[A] 102.5 Workmanship. Repairs, maintenance work, 
alterations or installations that are caused directly or 
indirectly by the enforcement of this code shall be 
executed and installed in a workmanlike manner and 
installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s 
instructions. 

[A] 102.6 Historic buildings. The provisions of this code 
shall not be mandatory for existing buildings or structures 
designated as historic buildings where such buildings or 
structures are judged by the building official to be safe and 
in the public interest of health, safety and welfare. 

[A] 102.7 Referenced codes and standards. The codes 
and standards referenced in this code shall be those that 
are listed in Chapter 8 and considered part of the 
requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each 
such reference and as further regulated in Sections 
102.7.1 and 102.7.2. 

Exception: Where enforcement of a code provision 
would violate the conditions of the listing of the 
equipment or appliance, the conditions of the listing 
shall apply. 



CHAPTER 1 
SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION 

 

Page 2 

[A] 102.7.1 Conflicts. Where conflicts occur between 
provisions of this code and the referenced standards, the 
provisions of this code shall apply. 

[A] 102.7.2 Provisions in referenced codes and 
standards. Where the extent of the reference to a 
referenced code or standard includes subject matter that 
is within the scope of this code, the provisions of this 
code, as applicable, shall take precedence over the 
provisions in the referenced code or standard. 

[A] 102.8 Requirements not covered by code. 
Requirements necessary for the strength, stability or proper 
operation of an existing fixture, structure or equipment, or for 
the public safety, health and general welfare, not specifically 
covered by this code, shall be determined by the building 
official. 

[A] 102.9 Application of references. References to chapter 
or section numbers, or to provisions not specifically identified 
by number, shall be construed to refer to such chapter, section 
or provision of this code. 

[A] 102.10 Other laws. The provisions of this code shall not 
be deemed to nullify any provisions of local, state or federal 
law. 

PART 2 — ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT 

SECTION 103 
DEPARTMENT OF PROPERTY MAINTENANCE 
INSPECTION BUILDING OFFICIAL, DEPUTIES, 

LIABILITY, AND FEES 

[A] 103.1 General. The department of property maintenance 
inspection is hereby created and the executive official in 
charge thereof shall be known as the building official. 

[A] 103.2 Appointment. The building official shall be 
appointed by the chief appointing authority City Manager of 
the jurisdiction. 

[A] 103.3 Deputies. In accordance with the prescribed 
procedures of this jurisdiction the City and with the 
concurrence of the appointing authority, the building official 
shall have the authority to may appoint a deputy(s). Such 
employees shall have powers as delegated by the building 
official. 

[A] 103.4 Liability. The building official, member of the board 
of appeals or employee charged with the enforcement of this 
code, while acting for the jurisdiction, in good faith and without 
malice in the discharge of the duties required by this code or 
other pertinent law or ordinance, shall not thereby be 
rendered civilly or criminally liable personally, and is hereby 
relieved from all personal liability for any damage accruing to 
persons or property as a result of an act or by reason of an 
act or omission in the discharge of official duties.  

[A] 103.4.1 Legal defense. Any suit or criminal complaint 
instituted against any officer or employee because of an 

act performed by that officer or employee in the lawful 
discharge of duties and under the provisions of this 
code shall be defended by the legal representative of 
the jurisdiction until the final termination of the 
proceedings. The building official or any subordinate 
shall not be liable for costs in an action, suit or 
proceeding that is instituted in pursuance of the 
provisions of this code. 

[A] 103.5 Fees. The fees for activities and services 
performed by the department in carrying out its 
responsibilities under this code shall be as indicated in the 
following schedule. [JURISDICTION TO INSERT 
APPROPRI ATE SCHEDULE.] under this code shall be 
as provided by the adopted fee schedule of the City. 

SECTION 104 
DUTIES AND POWERS OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL 

[A] 104.1 General. The building official is hereby 
authorized and directed to enforce the provisions of this 
code. The building official shall have the authority to 
render interpretations of this code and to adopt policies 
and procedures in order to clarify the application of its 
provisions. Such interpretations, policies and procedures 
shall be in compliance with the intent and purpose of this 
code. Such policies and procedures shall not have the 
effect of waiving requirements specifically provided for in 
this code. 

[A] 104.2 Inspections. The building official shall make all 
of the required inspections, or shall accept reports of 
inspection by approved agencies or individuals. Reports 
of such inspections shall be in writing and be certified by 
a responsible officer of such approved agency or by the 
responsible individual. The building official is authorized 
to engage such expert opinion as deemed necessary to 
report upon unusual technical issues that arise, subject to 
the approval of the appointing authority. 

[A] 104.3 Right of entry. Where it is necessary to make 
an inspection to enforce the provisions of this code, or 
whenever the building official has reasonable cause to 
believe that there exists in a structure or upon a premises 
a condition in violation of this code, the building official is 
authorized to enter the structure or premises at 
reasonable times to inspect or perform the duties imposed 
by this code, provided that if such structure or premises is 
occupied the building official shall present credentials to 
the occupant and request entry. If such structure or 
premises is unoccupied, the building official shall first 
make a reasonable effort to locate the owner, owner’s 
authorized agent,  or other person having charge or 
control of the structure or premises and request entry. If 
entry is refused, the building official shall have recourse 
to the remedies provided by law to secure entry. 



CHAPTER 1 
SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION 

 

Page 3 

[A] 104.4 Identification. The building official shall carry 
proper identification when inspecting structures or premises 
in the performance of duties under this code. 

[A] 104.5 Notices and orders. The building official shall issue 
all necessary notices or orders to ensure compliance with this 
code. 

[A] 104.6 Department records. The building official shall 
keep official records of all business and activities of the 
department specified in the provisions of this code. Such 
records shall be retained in the official records for the period 
required for retention of public records. 

SECTION 105 
APPROVAL 

[A] 105.1 Modifications. Whenever there are practical 
difficulties involved in carrying out the provisions of this code, 
the building official shall have the authority to grant 
modifications for individual cases upon application of the 
owner or owner’s authorized agent, provided the building 
official shall first find that special individual reason makes the 
strict letter of this code impractical, the modification is in 
compliance with the intent and purpose of this code and that 
such modification does not lessen health, life and fire safety 
requirements. The details of action granting modifications 
shall be recorded and entered in the department files. 

[A] 105.2 Alternative materials, methods and equipment. 
The provisions of this code are not intended to prevent the 
installation of any material or to prohibit any method of 
construction not specifically prescribed by this code, provided 
that any such alternative has been approved. An alternative 
material or method of construction shall be approved where 
the building official finds that the proposed design is 
satisfactory and complies with the intent of the provisions of 
this code, and that the material, method or work offered is, for 
the purpose intended, at least the equivalent of that 
prescribed in this code in quality, strength, effectiveness, fire 
resistance, durability and safety. Where the alternative 
material, design or method of construction in not approved, 
the building official shall respond in writing, stating the 
reasons the alternative was not approved. 

[A] 105.3 Required testing. Whenever there is insufficient 
evidence of compliance with the provisions of this code or 
evidence that a material or method does not conform to the 
requirements of this code, or in order to substantiate claims 
for alternative materials or methods, the building official shall 
have the authority to require tests to be made as evidence of 
compliance at no expense to the jurisdiction. 

[A] 105.3.1 Test methods. Test methods shall be as 
specified in this code or by other recognized test 
standards. In the absence of recognized and accepted 
test methods, the building official shall be permitted to 
approve appropriate testing procedures performed by an 
approved agency. 

[A] 105.3.2 Test reports. Reports of tests shall be 
retained by the building official for the period required 
for retention of public records. 

[A] 105.4 Used material and equipment. The use of 
used materials that meet the requirements of this code for 
new materials is permitted. Materials, equipment and 
devices shall not be reused unless such elements are in 
good repair or have been reconditioned and tested where 
necessary, placed in good and proper working condition 
and approved by the building official. 

[A] 105.5 Approved materials and equipment. 
Materials, equipment and devices approved by the 
building official shall be constructed and installed in 
accordance with such approval. 

[A] 105.6 Research reports. Supporting data, where 
necessary to assist in the approval of materials or 
assemblies not specifically provided for in this code, shall 
consist of valid research reports from approved sources. 

SECTION 106 
VIOLATIONS 

[A] 106.1 Unlawful acts. It shall be unlawful for a person, 
firm or corporation to be in conflict with or in violation of 
any of the provisions of this code. 

[A] 106.2 Notice of violation. The building official shall 
serve a notice of violation or order in accordance with 
Section 107; except, citations shall be issued and notice 
of citation provided in accordance with state law. 

[A] 106.3 Prosecution of violation. Any person failing to 
comply with a notice of violation or order served in 
accordance with Section 107 or issued citation shall be 
deemed guilty of a misdemeanor or civil infraction as 
determined by the local municipality, and the violation 
shall be deemed a strict liability offense. If the notice of 
violation is not complied with, the building official shall 
institute the appropriate proceeding at law or in equity to 
restrain, correct or abate such violation, or to require the 
removal or termination of the unlawful occupancy of the 
structure in violation of the provisions of this code or of the 
order or direction made pursuant thereto. Any action 
taken by the authority having jurisdiction on such 
premises shall be charged against the real estate upon 
which the structure is located and shall be a lien upon 
such real estate. 

 [A] 106.4 Violation penalties. Any person who shall 
violate a provision of this code, or fail to comply therewith, 
or with any of the requirements thereof, shall be 
prosecuted within the limits provided by state or local 
laws. Each day that a violation continues after due notice 
has been served shall be deemed a separate offense. 

[A] 106.5 Abatement of violation. The imposition of the 
penalties herein prescribed shall not preclude the legal 



CHAPTER 1 
SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION 

 

Page 4 

officer of the jurisdiction  city attorney or other counsel 
retained by the City from instituting appropriate action to 
restrain, correct or abate a violation, or to prevent illegal 
occupancy of a building, structure or premises, or to stop an 
illegal act, conduct, business or utilization of the building, 
structure or premises. 

SECTION 107 
NOTICES AND ORDERS 

[A] 107.1 Notice to person responsible. Whenever the 
building official determines that there has been a violation of 
this code or has grounds to believe that a violation has 
occurred, notice shall be given in the manner prescribed in 
Sections 107.2 and 107.3 to the person responsible for the 
violation owner as specified in this code and identified in 
accordance with section 107.1.1. Notices for condemnation 
procedures shall also comply with Section 108.3. 

[A] 107.1.1 Owner for purposes of this section. All 
notices shall be sent to the owner of the affected premises 
or structure, who shall be identified by a diligent search of  
the following records: 

1. county real property records of the county in 
which the building is located; 

2. appraisal district records of the appraisal district 
in which the building is located; 

3. records of the secretary of state; 

4. assumed name records of the county in which the 
building is located; 

5. tax records of the municipality;  and 

6. utility records of the municipality. 

|A] 107.2 Form. Such notice prescribed in Section 107.1 shall 
be in accordance with all of the following: 

1. Be in writing. 

2. Include a description of the real estate sufficient for 
identification. 

3. Include a statement of the violation or violations and 
why the notice is being issued. 

4. Include a correction order allowing a reasonable time to 
make the repairs and improvements required to bring 
the dwelling unit or structure into compliance with the 
provisions of this code. 

5. Inform the property owner or owner’s authorized agent 
of the right to appeal. 

6. Include a statement of the right to file a lien in 
accordance with Section 106.3. 

|A] 107.2.1 Additional requirements for notice of 
unsafe structure. In addition to the form prescribed 
in Section 107.2, notice of an unsafe structure shall 
include: 

1. the date of the scheduled public hearing; or a 
copy of the board of appeals or municipal 
court determination and order; 

2. a statement that the owner will be required to 
submit at the hearing proof of the scope of 
any work that may be required to comply with 
this code and city ordinances and the time it 
will take to reasonably perform the work; and 

3. a statement that the city may take the actions 
ordered if the owner does not complete those 
actions prior to the deadline imposed at the 
public hearing, which may be 30 days from 
the date of the public hearing. 

[A] 107.3 Method of service. Such notice shall be 
deemed to be properly served if a copy thereof is: 

1. Delivered personally; 

2. Sent by certified or first-class mail, return receipt 
requested, addressed to the last known address; 
or 

3. If the notice is returned showing that the letter 
was not delivered, a copy thereof shall be posted 
in a conspicuous place in or about the structure 
affected by such notice. 

[A] 107.4 Unauthorized tampering. Signs, tags or 
seals posted or affixed by the building official shall not 
be mutilated, destroyed or tampered with, or removed 
without authorization from the building official. 

[A] 107.5 Penalties. Penalties for noncompliance with 
orders and notices shall be as set forth in Section 106.4. 

[A] 107.6 Transfer of ownership. It shall be unlawful 
for the owner of any dwelling unit or structure who has 
received a compliance order or upon whom a notice of 
violation has been served to sell, transfer, mortgage, 
lease or otherwise dispose of such dwelling unit or 
structure to another until the provisions of the 
compliance order or notice of violation have been 
complied with, or until such owner or the owner’s 
authorized agent shall first furnish the grantee, 
transferee, mortgagee or lessee a true copy of any 
compliance order or notice of violation issued by the 
building official and shall furnish to the building official a 
signed and notarized statement from the grantee, 
transferee, mortgagee or lessee, acknowledging the 
receipt of such compliance order or notice of violation 
and fully accepting the responsibility without condition 



CHAPTER 1 
SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION 

 

Page 5 

for making the corrections or repairs required by such 
compliance order or notice of violation. 

SECTION 108 
UNSAFE STRUCTURES AND EQUIPMENT 

[A] 108.1 General. When a structure or equipment is found 
by the building official to be unsafe, the building official may 
recommend require the vacation, relocation of occupants, 
securing, repair, removal, or demolition of an unsafe 
structure or premises pursuant to the provisions of this 
code. 

[A] 108.1.1 Unsafe structures. An unsafe structure  is 
one that is found to be a hazard to the public health, 
safety, and welfare due to one or more of the following 
conditions: dangerous to the life, health, property or 
safety of the public or the occupants of the structure by 
not providing minimum safeguards to protect or warn 
occupants in the event of fire, or because such structure 
contains unsafe equipment or is so damaged, decayed, 
dilapidated, structurally unsafe or of such faulty 
construction or unstable foundation, that partial or 
complete collapse is possible.  

1. the structure is dilapidated as defined by section 
108.1.5, substandard as defined by section 
108.1.4, or unfit for human habitation as defined 
by section 108.1.3;  

2. the structure is, regardless of its structural 
condition, unoccupied by its owners, lessees, or 
other invitees and is unsecured from 
unauthorized entry to the extent that it could be 
entered or used by vagrants or other uninvited 
persons as a place of harborage or could be 
entered or used by children;  or 

3. the structure is boarded up, fenced, or otherwise 
secured in any manner that constitutes a danger 
to the public even though secured from entry;  or 
the means used to secure the building are 
inadequate to prevent unauthorized entry or use 
of the building in the manner described by 
subsection 2. 

[A] 108.1.2 Unsafe equipment. Unsafe equipment 
includes any boiler, heating equipment, elevator, moving 
stairway, electrical wiring or device, flammable liquid 
containers or other equipment on the premises or within 
the structure which is in such disrepair or condition that 
such equipment is a hazard to life, health, property or 
safety of the public or occupants of the premises or 
structure. 

[A] 108.1.3 Structure unfit for human occupancy. A 
structure is unfit for human occupancy whenever the 
building official finds that such structure is unsafe, 
unlawful or, because of the degree to which the structure 
is in disrepair or lacks maintenance, is insanitary, vermin 

or rat infested, contains filth and contamination, or 
lacks ventilation, illumination, sanitary or heating 
facilities or other essential equipment required by this 
code, or because the location of the structure 
constitutes a hazard to the occupants of the structure 
or to the public.  

[A] 108.1.4 Unlawful Substandard  structure. An 
unlawful A substandard structure is one found in 
whole or in part to be occupied by more persons than 
permitted under this code, or was erected, altered or 
occupied contrary to law. 

[A] 108.1.5 Dangerous Dilapidated structure or 
premises. For the purpose of this code, any structure 
or premises that has any or all of the conditions or 
defects described below shall be considered 
dangerous: 

1. Any door, aisle, passageway, stairway, exit 
or other means of egress that does not 
conform to the approved building or fire code 
of the jurisdiction as related to the 
requirements for existing buildings. 

2. The walking surface of any aisle, 
passageway, stairway, exit or other means of 
egress is so warped, worn loose, torn or 
otherwise unsafe as to not provide safe and 
adequate means of egress. 

3. Any portion of a building, structure or 
appurtenance that has been damaged by fire, 
earthquake, wind, flood, deterioration, 
neglect, abandonment, vandalism or by any 
other cause to such an extent that it is likely 
to partially or completely collapse, or to 
become detached or dislodged. 

4. Any portion of a building, or any member, 
appurtenance or ornamentation on the 
exterior thereof that is not of sufficient 
strength or stability, or is not so anchored, 
attached or fastened in place so as to be 
capable of resisting natural or artificial loads 
of one and one-half the original designed 
value. 

5. The building or structure, or part of the 
building or structure, because of dilapidation, 
deterioration, decay, faulty construction, the 
removal or movement of some portion of the 
ground necessary for the support, or for any 
other reason, is likely to partially or 
completely collapse, or some portion of the 
foundation or underpinning of the building or 
structure is likely to fail or give way. 



CHAPTER 1 
SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION 

 

Page 6 

6. The building or structure, or any portion thereof, 
is clearly unsafe for its use and occupancy. 

7. The building or structure is neglected, damaged, 
dilapidated, unsecured or abandoned so as to 
become an attractive nuisance to children who 
might play in the building or structure to their 
danger, becomes a harbor for vagrants, criminals 
or immoral persons, or enables persons to resort 
to the building or structure for committing a 
nuisance or an unlawful act. 

8. Any building or structure has been constructed, 
exists or is maintained in violation of any specific 
requirement or prohibition applicable to such 
building or structure provided by the approved 
building or fire code of the jurisdiction, or of any 
law or ordinance to such an extent as to present 
either a substantial risk of fire, building collapse 
or any other threat to life and safety. 

9. A building or structure, used or intended to be 
used for dwelling purposes, because of 
inadequate maintenance, dilapidation, decay, 
damage, faulty construction or arrangement, 
inadequate light, ventilation, mechanical or 
plumbing system, or otherwise, is determined by 
the building official to be unsanitary, unfit for 
human habitation or in such a condition that is 
likely to cause sickness or disease. 

10. Any building or structure, because of a lack of 
sufficient or proper fire-resistance-rated 
construction, fire protection systems, electrical 
system, fuel connections, mechanical system, 
plumbing system or other cause, is determined by 
the building official to be a threat to life or health. 

11. Any portion of a building remains on a site after 
the demolition or destruction of the building or 
structure or whenever any building or structure is 
abandoned so as to constitute such building or 
portion thereof as an attractive nuisance or 
hazard to the public. 

[A] 108.1.6 Procedure for Abatement of Unsafe 
Structures. If a structure has been identified as unsafe, 
the building official shall: 

1. schedule a public hearing with the board of 
appeals or, if none, the municipal court to 
determine whether the structure is unsafe and to 
order the structure vacated, secured, repaired, 
removed, or demolished by the owner and the 
occupants relocated within a reasonable time if 
such a determination is made;  

2. send notice in accordance with section 107 that 
the building official has identified an unsafe 
structure on the premises, including the specific 

conditions that render the structure unsafe 
and the date of the scheduled public hearing; 

3. file or cause to be filed a copy of the notice in 
the real property records of the county in 
which the unsafe structure is located; 

4. verify and document the condition of the 
unsafe structure within 48 hours of the 
scheduled public hearing; 

5. report the condition of the unsafe structure to 
the board of appeals or municipal court at the 
public hearing and recommend the vacation, 
relocation of occupants, securing, repair, 
removal, or demolition of the unsafe structure 
within 30 days; provided, the board of 
appeals or municipal court may allow the 
owner up to 90 days to repair, remove, or 
demolish the unsafe structure, or to submit at 
the hearing a detailed plan and time schedule 
for the work if the owner establishes at the 
hearing that the work cannot reasonably be 
completed within 90 days because of the 
scope and complexity of the work;  

6. send notice in accordance with section 107 of 
the board’s determination and order within 10 
days after the order is issued;  

7. publish or cause to be published in a 
newspaper of general circulation in the city in 
which the unsafe structure is located a notice 
containing: the street address or legal 
description of the property; the date the 
public hearing was held; a brief statement 
indicating the results of the order; and 
instructions stating where a complete copy of 
the order may be obtained; 

8. verify and document the condition of the 
unsafe structure following the date specified 
by the order; 

9. take no action nor cause any action to be 
taken until 20 days has elapsed from the date 
of the order with no appeal filed in 
accordance with section 111.1; 30 days has 
elapsed from the date of the order with no 
appeal for court review filed in accordance 
with section 111.7; and the condition of the 
unsafe structure remains unsafe; provided, if 
an appeal has been filed in accordance with 
sections 111.1 or 111.7, the appeal shall stay 
all enforcement, other than emergency 
measures taken under section 109, until the 
appeal is heard; and 

10. provided no appeal has been filed and the 
deadline for such appeal has elapsed, timely 



CHAPTER 1 
SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION 

 

Page 7 

commence the vacation, relocation of occupants, 
securing, repair, removal, or demolition of the 
unsafe structure pursuant to the order of the 
board of appeals or municipal court and 
document all actions taken. 

 [A] 108.2 Closing Securing of vacant structures. If the 
unsafe structure is vacant and unfit for human habitation and 
occupancy, and is not in danger of structural collapse, the 
building official is authorized to post a placard of 
condemnation on the premises and order the structure closed 
up and secured so as not to be an attractive nuisance. Upon 
failure of the owner or owner’s authorized agent to close up 
the premises within the time specified in the order, the building 
official shall cause the premises to be closed and secured 
through any available public agency or by contract or 
arrangement by private persons and the cost thereof shall be 
charged against the real estate upon which the structure is 
located and shall be a lien upon such real estate and shall be 
collected by any other legal resource.**process for securing 

[A] 108.2.1 Authority to disconnect service utilities. 
The building official shall have the authority to authorize 
disconnection or prevent connection of utility service to 
the building, structure or system regulated by this code 
and the referenced codes and standards set forth in 
Section 102.7 in case of emergency where necessary to 
enforce this code to eliminate an immediate hazard to life 
or property or where such utility connection has been 
made without approval. The building official shall notify 
the serving utility and, whenever possible, the owner or 
owner’s authorized agent and occupant of the building, 
structure or service system of the decision to disconnect 
prior to taking such action. If not notified prior to 
disconnection the owner, owner’s authorized agent or 
occupant of the building structure or service system shall 
be notified in writing as soon as practical thereafter. 

[A] 108.3 Notice and Placarding. Whenever the building 
official has condemned identified as unsafe a structure or 
equipment under the provisions of this section, notice shall be 
posted in a conspicuous place in or about the structure 
affected by such notice and served on the owner, owner’s 
authorized agent or the person or persons responsible for the 
structure or equipment in accordance with Section 107.3. If 
the notice pertains to equipment, it shall also be placed on the 
condemned unsafe equipment. The notice shall be in the form 
prescribed in Section 107.2 

[A] 108.4 Placarding. Upon failure of the owner, owner’s 
authorized agent or person responsible to comply with the 
notice provisions within the time given, The building official 
shall post on the premises or on defective equipment a 
placard bearing the word “condemned“ “Unsafe, it shall be 
unlawful to occupy this building” and a statement of the 
penalties provided for occupying the premises, operating the 
equipment or removing the placard. 

[A] 108.4.1 Placard removal. The building official shall 
remove the condemnation placard whenever the defect 
or defects upon which the condemnation and 
placarding action were based have been eliminated. 
Any person who defaces or removes a condemnation 
placard without the approval of the building official shall 
be subject to the penalties provided by this code. 

[A] 108.5 Prohibited occupancy Vacating of Structure. 
Any occupied structure condemned found to be unsafe 
and placarded by the building official shall be vacated as 
ordered by the building official. Any person who shall 
occupy a placarded premises or shall operate placarded 
equipment, and any owner, owner’s authorized agent or 
any person responsible for the premises who shall let 
anyone occupy a placarded premises or operate 
placarded equipment shall be liable for the penalties 
provided by this code. 

[A] 108.6 Abatement methods. The owner, owner’s 
authorized agent operator or occupant of a building, 
premises or equipment deemed unsafe by the building 
official shall abate or cause to be abated or corrected 
such unsafe conditions either by repair, rehabilitation, 
demolition or other approved corrective action. 

[A] 108.7 Record. The building official shall cause a 
report to be filed on an unsafe condition. The report shall 
state the occupancy of the structure and the nature of the 
unsafe condition. 

SECTION 109 
EMERGENCY MEASURES 

[A] 109.1 Imminent danger. When, in the opinion of the 
building official, there is imminent danger of failure or 
collapse of a building or structure that endangers life, or 
when any structure or part of a structure has fallen and 
life is endangered by the occupation of the structure, or 
when there is actual or potential danger to the building 
occupants or those in the proximity of any structure 
because of explosives, explosive fumes or vapors or the 
presence of toxic fumes, gases or materials, or operation 
of defective or dangerous equipment, the building official, 
after approval of the governing body of the City,  is hereby 
authorized and empowered to order and require the 
occupants to vacate the premises forthwith. The building 
official shall cause to be posted at each entrance to such 
structure a notice reading as follows: “This Structure Is 
Unsafe and Its Occupancy Has Been Prohibited by the 
Building official.” It shall be unlawful for any person to 
enter such structure except for the purpose of securing 
the structure, making the required repairs, removing the 
hazardous condition or of demolishing the same. 

[A] 109.2 Temporary safeguards. Notwithstanding other 
provisions of this code, whenever, in the opinion of the 
building official, there is imminent danger due to an 
unsafe condition, the building official shall may order the 



CHAPTER 1 
SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION 

 

Page 8 

necessary work to be done to temporarily secure the 
structure, including the boarding up of openings, to render 
such structure temporarily safe whether or not the legal 
procedure herein described has been instituted; and shall 
cause such other action to be taken as the building official 
deems necessary to meet such emergency; provided the 
structure is unoccupied or is occupied only by persons who 
do not have a right of possession to the building. Before the 
11th day after the date the structure is secured, notice shall be 
provided in accordance with section 107 

[A] 109.3 Closing streets. When necessary for public safety, 
the building official shall temporarily close structures and 
close, or order the authority having jurisdiction to close, 
sidewalks, streets, public ways and places adjacent to unsafe 
structures, and prohibit the same from being utilized. 

 [A] 109.4 Emergency repairs. For the purposes of this 
section, the building official shall employ the necessary labor 
and materials to perform the required work as expeditiously 
as possible. 

[A] 109.5 Costs of emergency repairs. Costs incurred in the 
performance of emergency work shall be paid by the 
jurisdiction. The legal counsel of the jurisdiction shall institute 
appropriate action against the owner or owner’s authorized 
agent of the premises where the unsafe structure is or was 
located for the recovery of such costs. 

[A] 109.6 Hearing. Any person ordered to take emergency 
measures shall comply with such order forthwith. Any affected 
person shall thereafter, upon written request petition directed 
to the appeals board within 30 days after the date the City 
secures the building, be afforded a hearing as described in 
this code within 20 days after the date the request is filed.  

SECTION 110 
DEMOLITION 

[A] 110.1 General. The building official shall order the owner 
or owner’s authorized agent of any premises upon which is 
located any structure, which in the building official’s or owner’s 
authorized agent judgment after review is so deteriorated or 
dilapidated or has become so out of repair as to be 
dangerous, unsafe, insanitary or otherwise unfit for human 
habitation or occupancy, and such that it is unreasonable to 
repair the structure, to demolish and remove such structure; 
or if such structure is capable of being made safe by repairs, 
to repair and make safe and sanitary, or to board up and hold 
for future repair or to demolish and remove at the owner’s 
option; or where there has been a cessation of normal 
construction of any structure for a period of more than two 
years, the building official shall order the owner or owner’s 
authorized agent to demolish and remove such structure, or 
board up until future repair. Boarding the building up for future 
repair shall not extend beyond one year, unless approved by 
the building official. 

[A] 110.2 Notices and orders. Notices and orders shall 
comply with Section 107. 

[A] 110.3 Failure to comply. If the owner of a premises 
or owner’s authorized agent fails to comply with a 
demolition order within the time prescribed, the building 
official, after approval of the governing body of the City, 
shall cause the structure to be demolished and removed, 
either through an available public agency or by contract 
or arrangement with private persons, and the cost of such 
demolition and removal shall be charged against the real 
estate upon which the structure is located and shall be a 
lien upon such real estate. 

[A] 110.4 Salvage materials. When any structure has 
been ordered demolished and removed, the governing 
body or other designated officer under said contract or 
arrangement aforesaid shall have the right to sell the 
salvage and valuable materials. The net proceeds of such 
sale, after deducting the expenses of such demolition and 
removal, shall be promptly remitted with a report of such 
sale or transaction, including the items of expense and the 
amounts deducted, for the person who is entitled thereto, 
subject to any order of a court. If such a surplus does not 
remain to be turned over, the report shall so state. 

SECTION 111 
MEANS OF APPEAL AND PUBLIC HEARINGS 

[A] 111.1 Application for appeal. Any person directly 
affected by a decision of the building official or a notice or 
order issued under this code shall have the right to appeal 
to the board of appeals, provided that a written application 
for appeal is filed within 20 days after the day the decision, 
notice or order was served, except as otherwise provided 
by section 109 for appeals of Emergency Repairs or other 
action taken under section 109. An application for appeal 
shall be based on a claim that the true intent of this code 
or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been 
incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of this code do not 
fully apply, or the requirements of this code are 
adequately satisfied by other means. An application for 
appeal under section 111.1 is an administrative remedy 
and shall not preclude an appeal for court review of an 
order by the board of appeals or municipal court in 
accordance with section 111.7. 

[A] 111.2 Membership of board. The board of appeals 
shall consist of not less than three members who are 
qualified by experience and training to pass on matters 
pertaining to property maintenance and who are not 
employees of the jurisdiction. The building official shall be 
an ex-officio member but shall have no vote on any matter 
before the board. The board shall be appointed by the 
chief appointing authority, and shall serve staggered and 
overlapping terms. 

 [A] 111.2.1 Alternate members. The chief appointing 
authority shall appoint not less than two alternate 



CHAPTER 1 
SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION 

 

Page 9 

members who shall be called by the board chairman to hear 
appeals during the absence or disqualification of a member. 
Alternate members shall possess the qualifications required 
for board membership. 

[A] 111.2.2 Chairman. The board shall annually select one of 
its members to serve as chairman. 

[A] 111.2.3 Disqualification of member. A member shall not 
hear an appeal in which that member has a personal, 
professional or financial interest. 

[A] 111.2.4 Secretary. The chief administrative officer shall 
designate a qualified person to serve as secretary to the 
board. The secretary shall file a detailed record of all 
proceedings in the office of the chief administrative officer. 

[A] 111.2.5 Compensation of members. Compensation of 
members shall be determined by law. 

[A] 111.3 Notice of meeting. The jurisdiction City may, but is 
not required to, hold additional public hearings as part of the 
procedure for the abatement of unsafe structures prescribed 
in section 108.1.6. Notice of such additional public hearings 
shall be sent to the owner in accordance with section 107.  

[A] 111.4 Open hearing. Hearings before the board shall be 
subject to the Open Meetings Act. open to the public. The 
appellant, the appellant’s representative, the building official 
and any person whose interests are affected shall be given an 
opportunity to be heard. A quorum shall consist of a minimum 
of two-thirds of the board membership. 

[A] 111.4.1 Procedure. The board shall adopt and make 
available to the public through the secretary procedures, if 
any, under which a hearing will be conducted. The procedures 
shall not require compliance with strict rules of evidence, but 
shall mandate that only relevant information be received. 

 [A] 111.5 Postponed hearing. When the full board is not 
present to hear an appeal, either the appellant or the 
appellant’s representative shall have the right to request a 
postponement of the hearing. 

[A] 111.6 Board decision. The board shall modify or reverse 
the decision of the building official only by a concurring vote 
of a majority of the total number of appointed board members. 

[A] 111.6.1 Records and copies. The decision of the board 
shall be recorded. Copies shall be furnished to the appellant 
and to the building official. 

[A] 111.6.2 Administration. The building official shall take 
immediate action in accordance with the decision of the 
board. 

[A] 111.7 Court review. Any person, whether or not a 
previous party of the appeal, shall have the right to apply to 
the appropriate court for a writ of certiorari to correct errors of 
law. Application for review shall be made in the manner and 
time required by law. following the filing of the decision in the 

office of the chief administrative officer. Appeals under 
this section must be filed in the district court within the 
county where the unsafe structure is located within 30 
days of the date the order is issued by the board of 
appeals or municipal court. 

[A] 111.8 Stays of enforcement. Appeals of notice and 
orders (other than Imminent Danger notices) shall stay 
the enforcement of the notice and order until the appeal 
is heard by the appeals board or municipal court. 

SECTION 112 
STOP WORK ORDER 

[A] 112.1 Authority. Whenever the building official finds 
any work regulated by this code being performed in a 
manner contrary to the provisions of this code or in a 
dangerous or unsafe manner, the building official is 
authorized to issue a stop work order. 

[A] 112.2 Issuance. A stop work order shall be in writing 
and shall be given to the owner of the property, to the 
owner’s authorized agent, or to the person doing the work. 
Upon issuance of a stop work order, the cited work shall 
immediately cease. The stop work order shall state the 
reason for the order and the conditions under which the 
cited work is authorized to resume. 

[A] 112.3 Emergencies. Where an emergency exists, the 
building official shall not be required to give a written 
notice prior to stopping the work. 

[A] 112.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall 
continue any work after having been served with a stop 
work order, except such work as that person is directed to 
perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be 
liable to a fine of not less than [AMOUNT] dollars or more 
than $2,000.00 dollars per violation. 

 

 


